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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Amco Pump Manufacturing, Inc. 2022 Amco - BuyBoard pricelist 15% Yes

Austin Armature Works L.P. AAW Master pricelist 20% Yes
Advanced Water Well 
Technologies Advanced Water Well Technologies pricelist (4% - 10%) 4% Yes

Pierce Pump Company AMT Pumps pricelist 25% Yes

Sunbelt Pools, Inc. Aurora 3801 pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Barnes pricelist 5% No

Precision Pump Systems Barnes pricelist 10% No

Pierce Pump Company Barnes Pumps pricelist 15% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Benshaw pricelist 30% Yes

Pierce Pump Company BJM & Stancor Pumps 15% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Brook Crompton Motors pricelist 29% Yes

Spaeth Machine Shop, Inc. Cla-Val pricelist 30% Yes

Coastal Pump Services Coastal Pump Services pricelist 15% Yes

Spaeth Machine Shop, Inc. Crane - Demming pricelist 30% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Deming pricelist 5% No

Precision Pump Systems Deming pricelist 10% Yes

Global Pump Solutions Franklin Engineered Products pricelist 10% Yes

Alsay Incorporated Franklin Motor pricelist 10% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated GE pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Gorman Rupp pricelist 10% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Goulds pricelist 20% Yes

Alsay Incorporated Grundfos pricelist 10% No

Weisinger Incorporated Grundfos pricelist 20% Yes
Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company Hotsy Carlson Catalog 10% No

Alklean Industries, Inc. Hotsy pricelist 15% No

Lewis Electric Motors, Inc. Lewis Electric Catalog 30% Yes

1. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Water and Wastewater Pumps - Wholesale Product Line.

For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023
Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

1. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Water and Wastewater Pumps - Wholesale Product Line.

For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023
Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Liberty Wholesale pricelist 5% Yes

Roger Brown Co. LLC Marathon and Leeson pricelist 10% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Nidec - US Motors pricelist 29% Yes

Sunbelt Pools, Inc. Pentair 2021 pricelist 20% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic pricelist 17% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated PGI pricelist 20% Yes
Pump Mechanical Technical 
Service LLC PMT Service pricelist 20% Yes

Pollardwater Pollarwater pricelist 5% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Precision Pump Field Service pricelist 10% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Raycap - Strikesorb pricelist 30% Yes

Roger Brown Co. LLC Rexnord pricelist 10% Yes

Pierce Pump Company SJE Rhombus pricelist 25% Yes

Roger Brown Co. LLC SKF pricelist 30% Yes

Alsay Incorporated SME pricelist 10% No

Weisinger Incorporated SME pricelist 20% Yes

Global Pump Solutions Sulzer 2022 pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Sulzer pricelist 10% Yes

Roger Brown Co. LLC TB Woods pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Teco pricelist 10% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Toshiba AS3 ASD pricelist 36% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Toshiba Medium Voltage ASD pricelist 30% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Toshiba Motors pricelist 30% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Toshiba P9 ASD pricelist 36% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Toshiba Plus Pack ASD pricelist 30% Yes

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Toshiba Power Apparatus & Comp pricelist 30% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Toshiba pricelist 10% Yes
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

1. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Water and Wastewater Pumps - Wholesale Product Line.

For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023
Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative

San Antonio Armature Works, Inc. Toshiba W7 ASD pricelist 25% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi 3 Phase pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Corrosion pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Portable Pumps pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Process Equipment pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Sewage and Wastewater pricelist 10% Yes

Alsay Incorporated US Motors pricelist 10% No

Weisinger Incorporated US pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Warren Rupp pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Weinman pricelist 5% No

Precision Pump Systems Weinman pricelist 10% Yes

Xylem Dewatering Solutions, Inc. Xylem BuyBoard pricelist 0% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Zoeller Wholesale pricelist 5% Yes
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Amco Pump Manufacturing, Inc. 2022 Amco - BuyBoard pricelist 15% Yes

Austin Armature Works L.P. AAW Master pricelist 20% Yes

Spaeth Machine Shop, Inc. ABB- vfds and motors pricelist 30% Yes

Global Pump Solutions Atlas Copco Flow pricelist 15% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. BJM - Pump pricelist 5% Yes

Coastal Pump Services Coastal Pump Services pricelist 15% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Ebara Pumps pricelist 20% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Flowserve - Pump pricelist 10% Yes

Global Pump Solutions Franklin Engineered Products pricelist 10% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated GE pricelist 20% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Goulds pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Grundfos Dosing Pumps pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Grundfos Multi-Stage Pumps pricelist 20% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Grundfos pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Grundfos Wastewater Pumps pricelist 5% Yes
Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company Hotsy Carlson Catalog 10% No

Alklean Industries, Inc. Hotsy pricelist 15% No

Lewis Electric Motors, Inc. Lewis Electric Catalog 0% No

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Liberty Engineered pricelist 20% Yes

Alsay Incorporated National Pump Company pricelist 10% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic Aurora pricelist 15% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic Fairbanks pricelist 15% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic pricelist 15% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated PGI pricelist 20% Yes
Pump Mechanical Technical 
Service LLC PMT Service pricelist 20% Yes

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

2. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Water and Wastewater Pumps - Engineered Product Line. (For this line-item vendor 
shall propose base model engineered water pumps. Engineered product options, see line #3 below, will be selected by the 
Cooperative member at the time of order).
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

2. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Water and Wastewater Pumps - Engineered Product Line. (For this line-item vendor 
shall propose base model engineered water pumps. Engineered product options, see line #3 below, will be selected by the 
Cooperative member at the time of order).

Weisinger Incorporated SME pricelist 20% Yes

Global Pump Solutions Sulzer 2022 pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Summit CC/FM Booster Pumps pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Summit SN Self-Priming Pumps pricelist 15% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated US pricelist 20% Yes

Xylem Dewatering Solutions, Inc. Xylem BuyBoard pricelist 0% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Zoeller Engineered pricelist 20% Yes
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Austin Armature Works L.P. AAW Master pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Abb Baldor pricelist 20% No

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Armstrong pricelist 5% No

Precision Pump Systems Barnes Grinder pricelist 10% No

Smith Pump Company, Inc. BJM - Parts pricelist 5% Yes

Coastal Pump Services Coastal Pump Services pricelist 15% Yes

Spaeth Machine Shop, Inc. Ebarra Pumps pricelist 30% No

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Flowserve - Pump pricelist 0% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated GE pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Gorman Rupp pricelist 10% No

Weisinger Incorporated Goulds pricelist 20% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Grundfos pricelist 20% Yes
Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company Hotsy Carlson Catalog 10% No

Alklean Industries, Inc. Hotsy pricelist 15% No

Lewis Electric Motors, Inc. Lewis Electric Catalog 30% No

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Liberty Engineered pricelist 20% Yes

Alsay Incorporated National Pump Company pricelist 10% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. NIDEC pricelist 10% No

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic pricelist 15% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated PGI pricelist 20% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated SME pricelist 20% Yes

Global Pump Solutions Sulzer 2022 pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Sulzer pricelist 10% No

Precision Pump Systems Teco pricelist 10% No

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

3. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Purchase of Water and Wastewater Pumps - Optional Equipment and Parts for 
Engineered Product Line (Options will be selected by the Cooperative member at the time of order. A COMPLETE LIST OF ALL 
OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT AND PARTS MUST BE SUBMITTED WITH PROPOSAL FOR PROPOSAL TO BE CONSIDERED.)
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

3. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Purchase of Water and Wastewater Pumps - Optional Equipment and Parts for 
Engineered Product Line (Options will be selected by the Cooperative member at the time of order. A COMPLETE LIST OF ALL 
OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT AND PARTS MUST BE SUBMITTED WITH PROPOSAL FOR PROPOSAL TO BE CONSIDERED.)

Precision Pump Systems Toshiba pricelist 10% No

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi 3 Phase pricelist 10% No

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Corrosion pricelist 10% No

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Sewage and Wastewater pricelist 10% No

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. US MOTOR/NIDEC 10% No

Weisinger Incorporated US pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Weinman pricelist 10% No

Xylem Dewatering Solutions, Inc. Xylem BuyBoard pricelist 0% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Zoeller Engineered pricelist 20% Yes
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Austin Armature Works L.P. AAW Master pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Armstrong pricelist 5% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Barnes pricelist 10% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Barnes pricelist 5% No

Pierce Pump Company BJM & Stancor Pumps pricelist 15% Yes

Coastal Pump Services Coastal Pump Services pricelist 15% No

Precision Pump Systems Deming pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Gorman Rupp pricelist 10% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Grundfos Package LS & Controls pricelist 1% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Grundfos Wastewater Pumps pricelist 5% Yes

Alsay Incorporated HCP pricelist 10% Yes
Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company Hotsy Carlson Catalog 10% No

Alklean Industries, Inc. Hotsy pricelist 15% No

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Liberty Engineered pricelist 0% No

Precision Pump Systems Precision Pump Field Service pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Sulzer Mixer pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Sulzer Spare Parts pricelist 10% No

Precision Pump Systems Sulzer Waste Water pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Teco pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Toshiba pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi 3 Phase pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Portable pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Process Equipment pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Sewage and Waste Water pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Corrision pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Weinman pricelist 10% Yes

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

4. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Water and Wastewater Pumps - Utility Services Sewer Lift Station.
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

4. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Water and Wastewater Pumps - Utility Services Sewer Lift Station.

Xylem Dewatering Solutions, Inc. Xylem BuyBoard pricelist 0% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Zoeller Engineered pricelist 0% No
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Amco Pump Manufacturing, Inc. 2022 Amco - Parts for Pumps pricelist 15% Yes

Lake Management Services LP 2022 Otterbine Parts pricelist 0% Yes

Austin Armature Works L.P. AAW Master pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Abb Baldor pricelist 20% Yes
Advanced Water Well 
Technologies Advanced Water Well Technologies (0% -  10%) 0% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Armstrong pricelist 5% Yes

Sunbelt Pools, Inc. Aurora June 2021 pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Barnes Grinder pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Barnes Sump pricelist 10% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. BJM - Parts Pricelist 5% Yes

Coastal Pump Services Coastal Pump Services pricelist 15% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Deming pricelist 10% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Flowserve - Pump pricelist 0% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated GE pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Gorman Rupp pricelist 10% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Goulds pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Grundfos Dosing pricelist 20% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Grundfos pricelist 20% Yes

Alsay Incorporated HCP pricelist 10% Yes
Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company Hotsy Carlson Catalog 10% No

Alklean Industries, Inc. Hotsy pricelist 15% No

Lewis Electric Motors, Inc. Lewis Electric Catalog 30% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Liberty Engineered pricelist 20% Yes

Roger Brown Co. LLC Marathon and Leeson pricelist 10% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. NIDEC pricelist 10% Yes

Sunbelt Pools, Inc. Pentair 2021 pricelist 20% Yes

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

5. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Parts for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors.
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

5. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Parts for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors.

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic Aurora pricelist 15% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic Fairbanks pricelist 10% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic pricelist 15% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated PGI pricelist 20% Yes
Pump Mechanical Technical 
Service LLC PMT Service pricelist 20% Yes

Roger Brown Co. LLC Rexnord (Regal) pricelist 10% Yes

Roger Brown Co. LLC SKF pricelist 30% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated SME pricelist 20% Yes

Global Pump Solutions Sulzer 2022 pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Sulzer Spare Parts pricelist 10% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Summit CC/FM Booster Pumps 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Summit SN Self-Priming Pumps pricelist 15% Yes

Roger Brown Co. LLC TB Woods (Altra) pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Teco pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Toshiba pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Sewage and Wastewater pricelist 10% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. US MOTOR pricelist 10% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated US pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Warren Rupp pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company WEG Motors pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Weinman pricelist 10% Yes

Pierce Pump Company World Wide Electric Motors pricelist 20% Yes

Xylem Dewatering Solutions, Inc. Xylem BuyBoard pricelist 0% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Zoeller Engineered pricelist 20% Yes

Spaeth Machine Shop, Inc. Zoeller pumps pricelist 30% Yes
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Austin Armature Works L.P. AAW Master pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Barnes Grinder pricelist 10% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Barnes pricelist 5% No

Pierce Pump Company BJM & Stancor Pumps 15% Yes

Coastal Pump Services Coastal Pump Services pricelist 15% Yes

Global Pump Solutions Franklin Engineered Products pricelist 15% Yes

Pierce Pump Company Grundfos Package LS & Controls pricelist 1% Yes

Alsay Incorporated HCP pricelist 10% Yes
Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company Hotsy Carlson Catalog 10% No

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Liberty Engineered pricelist 20% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic Aurora pricelist 15% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic pricelist 15% Yes
Pump Mechanical Technical 
Service LLC PMT Service pricelist 20% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Sulzer Spare Parts pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Sulzer Waste Water pricelist 10% Yes

Precision Pump Systems Tsurumi Sewage and Wastewater pricelist 10% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Zoeller Engineered pricelist 20% Yes

Spaeth Machine Shop, Inc. Zoeller Pumps pricelist 30% Yes

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

6. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Package Residential and Commercial Waste Grinder Station.
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Lake Management Services LP 2022 AquaMaster pricelist 0% Yes

Lake Management Services LP 2022 Kasco pricelist 0% Yes

Lake Management Services LP 2022 Otterbine FTN pricelist 0% Yes

Lake Management Services LP 2022 Otterbine FTN pricelist 0% Yes

Austin Armature Works L.P. AAW Master pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Abb Baldor pricelist 20% Yes

Lake Management Services LP Aquamaster Catalog 0% Yes

A W Chesterton ARC Epoxy Coatings for Pumps pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Barnes pricelist 5% Yes

A W Chesterton Chesterton Connect pricelist 5% Yes

Coastal Pump Services Coastal Pump Services pricelist 15% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. DEMING pricelist 5% Yes

A W Chesterton Enviroseal Spiraltrac Bushing pricelist 5% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated GE pricelist 20% Yes

Odessa Pumps Gorman Rupp pricelist 0% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Goulds pricelist 20% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Grundfos pricelist 20% Yes
Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company Hotsy Carlson Catalog 10% Yes

Alklean Industries, Inc. Hotsy pricelist 15% Yes

Alsay Incorporated HPC pricelist 10% Yes

Lewis Electric Motors, Inc. Lewis Electric Catalog 20% Yes

A W Chesterton Mechanical Packing for Pumps pricelist 15% Yes

A W Chesterton Mechanical Seals for Pumps pricelist 15% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Nidec - Motors pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. NIDEC pricelist 10% No

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Omnisite pricelist 5% Yes

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

7. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motor Related Products.
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

7. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for All Other Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motor Related Products.

Spaeth Machine Shop, Inc. Peerless Pumps pricelist 30% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic Aurora pricelist 15% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic Fairbanks pricelist 15% Yes

Odessa Pumps Pentair Hydromatic pricelist 15% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated PGI pricelist 20% Yes
Advanced Water Well 
Technologies Plugging services price list 1 0.0% Yes
Pump Mechanical Technical 
Service LLC PMT Service pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company SJE Rhombus pricelist 25% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated SME pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. US MOTOR pricelist 10% Yes

Weisinger Incorporated US pricelist 20% Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Wastewater Level pricelist 0% Yes

Sunbelt Pools, Inc. WEG E Technical pricelist 20% Yes

Pierce Pump Company WEG Motors pricelist 20% Yes

Hamilton Electric Works, Inc. Weinman pricelist 5% Yes

Pierce Pump Company World Wide Electric Motors pricelist 20% Yes

Xylem Dewatering Solutions, Inc. Xylem BuyBoard pricelist 0% Yes
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Percent 
Discount Award

Coastal Pump Services Coastal Pump Services pricelist 15% No
Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company Hotsy Carlson Catalog 10% No

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

8. Discount (%) Off Catalog /Pricelist for Compliance Services for Water and Wastewater System Operators - (evaluation and 
testing for compliance of water and wastewater, development/review of emergency response plans, training/continuing education for 
risk management plan compliance, development/review of client process plans for regulatory compliance with the Environmental 
Protection Agency (EPA) or other regulatory agency audit requirements and related services).
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

San Antonio Armature Works, 
Inc.

Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. ($65.00 - $95.00) $65.00 Yes

Alsay Incorporated Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $75.00 Yes

RPM Services, Inc. Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $80.00 Yes

Odessa Pumps Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $82.00 Yes

Smith Pump Company, Inc. Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $100.00 Yes

Willbanks & Associates, Inc. Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $100.00 No

Hotsy Carlson Equipment 
Company

Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $110.00 Yes

Pump Mechanical Technical 
Service LLC

Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $120.00 Yes

Alklean Industries, Inc. Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $125.00 Yes

Coastal Pump Services Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $125.00 Yes

Spaeth Machine Shop, Inc. Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $130.00 Yes

Lewis Electric Motors, Inc. Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $135.00 Yes

Pierce Pump Company Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $135.00 Yes

Sunbelt Pools, Inc. Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $135.00 Yes

A W Chesterton Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $150.00 Yes

Austin Armature Works L.P. Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $150.00 Yes

Global Pump Solutions Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $150.00 Yes

Lake Management Services LP Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $150.00 Yes

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

9. Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Water and Wastewater Pumps, Motors, and Related Items -- 
Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products.
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Vendor Name Vendor Catalog Information Bid Price Award

The Local Government Purchasing Cooperative
For the Period 07/01/2022 to 06/30/2023

Final Catalog Award Report for Water and Wastewater Pumps and Motors 672-22

9. Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Water and Wastewater Pumps, Motors, and Related Items -- 
Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of Equipment and Products.

Xylem Dewatering Solutions, 
Inc.

Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $150.00 Yes

Precision Pump Systems Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $195.00 Yes

Advanced Water Well 
Technologies

Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. ($225.00 - $425.00) $225.00 Yes

Weisinger Incorporated Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of 
Equipment and Products. $705.00 Yes
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1
4
8

Wisconsin

Wisconsin

 Wisconsin
(Optional: Check if applicable)

1
4
9

Wyoming

Wyoming

 Wyoming
(Optional: Check if applicable)

Bid Lines

1 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Water and Wastewater
Pumps - Wholesale Product Line. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be considered. 
(Response required)

 Total: %

Item Notes: Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or
catalog/pricelist per line item must submit the information as follows or
proposal may not be considered:

Select "Add Alternate" for each additional manufacturer product line
and/or catalog/pricelist proposed
Vendor’s must list one specific percentage discount for each
manufacturer and/or catalog/pricelist listed

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not include SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 30 characters allowed)

2 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Water and Wastewater
Pumps - Engineered Product Line (For this line-item vendor shall propose base model engineered water
pumps. Engineered product options, see line #3 below, will be selected by the Cooperative member at the time
of order). Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be considered. 
(Response required)

 Total: %

Item Notes: Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or
catalog/pricelist per line item must submit the information as follows or
proposal may not be considered:

Select "Add Alternate" for each additional manufacturer product line
and/or catalog/pricelist proposed
Vendor’s must list one specific percentage discount for each
manufacturer and/or catalog/pricelist listed

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Page 23 of 28 pages Deadline: 1/20/2022 04:00 PM (CT) 672-22
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Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not include SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 30 characters allowed)

3 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Water and Wastewater
Pumps - Optional Equipment and Parts for Engineered Product Line (Options will be selected by the
Cooperative member at the time of order. A COMPLETE LIST OF ALL OPTIONAL EQUIPMENT AND PARTS
MUST BE SUBMITTED WITH PROPOSAL FOR PROPOSAL TO BE CONSIDERED.) Catalog/Pricelist MUST
be included or proposal will not be considered. 
(Response required)

 Total: %

Item Notes: Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or
catalog/pricelist per line item must submit the information as follows or
proposal may not be considered:

Select "Add Alternate" for each additional manufacturer product line
and/or catalog/pricelist proposed
Vendor’s must list one specific percentage discount for each
manufacturer and/or catalog/pricelist listed

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not include SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 30 characters allowed)

4 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Water and Wastewater
Pumps - Utility Services Sewer Lift Station. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be
considered. 
(Response required)

 Total: %

Item Notes: Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or
catalog/pricelist per line item must submit the information as follows or
proposal may not be considered:

Select "Add Alternate" for each additional manufacturer product line
and/or catalog/pricelist proposed
Vendor’s must list one specific percentage discount for each
manufacturer and/or catalog/pricelist listed

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)
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Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not include SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 30 characters allowed)

5 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Parts for Water and
Wastewater Pumps and Motors. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be considered. 
(Response required)

 Total: %

Item Notes: Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or
catalog/pricelist per line item must submit the information as follows or
proposal may not be considered:

Select "Add Alternate" for each additional manufacturer product line
and/or catalog/pricelist proposed
Vendor’s must list one specific percentage discount for each
manufacturer and/or catalog/pricelist listed

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not include SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 30 characters allowed)

6 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for Package Residential
and Commercial Waste Grinder Station. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be
considered. 
(Response required)

 Total: %

Item Notes: Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or
catalog/pricelist per line item must submit the information as follows or
proposal may not be considered:

Select "Add Alternate" for each additional manufacturer product line
and/or catalog/pricelist proposed
Vendor’s must list one specific percentage discount for each
manufacturer and/or catalog/pricelist listed

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not include SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 30 characters allowed)
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7 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies - Discount (%) off catalog/pricelist for All Other Water and
Wastewater Pumps and Motor Related Products. Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be
considered. 
(Response required)

 Total: %

Item Notes: Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or
catalog/pricelist per line item must submit the information as follows or
proposal may not be considered:

Select "Add Alternate" for each additional manufacturer product line
and/or catalog/pricelist proposed
Vendor’s must list one specific percentage discount for each
manufacturer and/or catalog/pricelist listed

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not include SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 30 characters allowed)

8 Section II: Compliance Services - Water and Wastewater System Operators - Discount (%) off
catalog/pricelist for Compliance Services for Water and Wastewater System Operators - (evaluation and
testing for compliance of water and wastewater, development/review of emergency response plans,
training/continuing education for risk management plan compliance, development/review of client process plans
for regulatory compliance with the Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) or other regulatory agency audit
requirements and related services). Catalog/Pricelist MUST be included or proposal will not be considered. 
(Response required)

 Total: %

Item Notes: Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or
catalog/pricelist per line item must submit the information as follows or
proposal may not be considered:

Select "Add Alternate" for each additional manufacturer product line
and/or catalog/pricelist proposed
Vendor’s must list one specific percentage discount for each
manufacturer and/or catalog/pricelist listed

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Catalog/Pricelist Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not include SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 30 characters allowed)
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9 Section II: Installation and Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Water
and Wastewater Pumps, Motors, and Related Items -- Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair
Service of Equipment and Products.
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hourly Labor Rate Price: $ Total: $

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)
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