

EXHIBIT**A**

**AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE CITY OF ROUND ROCK
AND MOBOTREX, LLC
FOR THE PURCHASE OF
TRAFFIC SIGNAL SYSTEMS AND SAFETY BARRIER PRODUCTS**

THE STATE OF TEXAS

§

CITY OF ROUND ROCK

§

§

KNOW ALL BY THESE PRESENTS:

§

COUNTY OF WILLIAMSON

§

COUNTY OF TRAVIS

§

This Agreement for the purchase of traffic signal systems and safety barrier products (the “Agreement”) is made and entered into this the ____ day of _____, 2026, (the “Effective Date”) by and between the CITY OF ROUND ROCK, TEXAS, a home-rule municipality whose offices are located at 221 East Main Street, Round Rock, Texas 78664, referred to herein as the “City,” and MoboTrex, LLC, whose offices are located at 109 West 55th Street, Davenport, Indiana 52806, referred to herein as “Vendor.”

RECITALS:

WHEREAS, City desires to purchase traffic signal systems and safety barrier products;
and

WHEREAS, City is a member of the Buy Board Cooperative Purchasing Program (the “Buy Board”) and Vendor is an approved Buy Board vendor through Buy Board Contract # 795-26 (<https://app.buyboard.com/Shop/Vendors/Details?Id=4428>); and

WHEREAS, City desires to purchase certain goods and/or services from Vendor through Buy Board as set forth herein; and

WHEREAS, the parties desire to enter into this Agreement to set forth in writing their respective rights, duties, and obligations;

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual promises contained herein and other good and valuable consideration, the receipt and sufficiency of which are hereby acknowledged, the parties mutually agree as follows:

1.0 DEFINITIONS

A. **Agreement** means this binding legal contract between City and Vendor whereby City agrees to purchase specified goods and/or services and Vendor is obligated to sell same. The Agreement includes any exhibits, addenda, and/or amendments thereto.

- B. **City** means the City of Round Rock, Williamson and Travis Counties, Texas.
- C. **Effective Date** means the date set out in the introductory paragraph above.
- D. **Goods and Services** mean the specified services, supplies, materials, commodities, or equipment.
- E. **Vendor** means MoboTrex, LLC, or any successors or assigns.

2.0 EFFECTIVE DATE AND TERM

- A. This Agreement shall remain in full force and effect until it expires as indicated herein or is terminated in accordance with Section 14.0.
- B. The term of this Agreement shall begin with the Effective Date and end on the 31st day of March, 2029.

3.0 SCOPE OF WORK

- A. The goods and related services which are the subject matter of this Agreement are described generally herein and referenced in in the attached **Exhibit "A,"** incorporated herein by reference for all purposes
- B. This Agreement shall evidence the entire understanding and agreement between the parties and shall supersede any prior proposals, correspondence or discussions.
- C. Vendor shall satisfactorily provide all deliverables and services described herein and referenced in **Exhibit "A"** within the contract term specified. A change in the Scope of Services or any term of this Agreement, including bonding requirements, must be negotiated and agreed to in all relevant details, and must be embodied in a valid Supplemental Agreement as described herein.

4.0 COSTS

- A. In consideration for the Goods and Services to be provided by Vendor, City agrees to pay Vendor the amounts set forth in **Exhibit "A."**
- B. The City is authorized to pay the Vendor an amount not-to-exceed **\$2,500,000.00**, for the term of this Agreement.

5.0 INVOICES

All invoices shall include, at a minimum, the following information:

1. Name and address of Vendor;

2. Purchase Order Number;
3. Description and quantity of items received; and
4. Delivery dates.

6.0 NON-APPROPRIATION AND FISCAL FUNDING

This Agreement is a commitment of City's current revenues only. It is understood and agreed that City shall have the right to terminate this Agreement if the governing body of City does not appropriate funds sufficient to purchase the Goods and Services as determined by City's budget for the fiscal year in question. City may affect such termination by giving the Vendor written notice of termination.

7.0 PROMPT PAYMENT POLICY

In accordance with Chapter 2251, V.T.C.A., Texas Government Code, any payment to be made by City to Vendor will be made within thirty (30) days of the date City receives Goods and Services under this Agreement, the date the performance of the services under this Agreement are completed, or the date City receives a correct invoice for the Goods and Services, whichever is later. Vendor may charge interest on an overdue payment at the rate in effect on September 1 of the fiscal year in which the payment becomes overdue, in accordance with V.T.C.A., Texas Government Code, Section 2251.025(b). This Prompt Payment Policy does not apply to payments made by City in the event:

1. There is a bona fide dispute between City and Vendor, a contractor, subcontractor, or supplier about the goods delivered or the service performed that cause the payment to be late; or
2. There is a bona fide dispute between Vendor and a subcontractor or between a subcontractor and its supplier about the goods delivered or the service performed that causes the payment to be late; or
3. The terms of a federal contract, grant, regulation, or statute prevent City from making a timely payment with federal funds; or
4. The invoice is not mailed to City in strict accordance with any instruction on the purchase order relating to the payment.

8.0 GRATUITIES AND BRIBES

City may, by written notice to Vendor, cancel this Agreement without liability to Vendor if it is determined by City that gratuities or bribes in the form of entertainment, gifts, or otherwise were offered or given by Vendor or its agents or representatives to any City officer, employee or elected representative with respect to the performance of this Agreement. In addition, Vendor may be subject to penalties stated in Title 8 of the Texas Penal Code.

9.0 TAXES

City is exempt from Federal Excise and State Sales Tax; therefore, tax shall not be included in Vendor's charges.

10.0 INSURANCE

Vendor shall meet all City insurance requirements set forth on the City's website at: <https://www.roundrocktexas.gov/wp-content/uploads/2024/12/CORR-Insurance-08-2024.pdf>

11.0 CITY'S REPRESENTATIVE

City hereby designates the following representative authorized to act in its behalf with regard to this Agreement:

Clay Ericson
Public Works Department
221 E. Main Street.
Round Rock, TX 78664
(512) 341-3185
cericson@roundrocktexas.gov

12.0 RIGHT TO ASSURANCE

Whenever either party to this Agreement, in good faith, has reason to question the other party's intent to perform hereunder, then demand may be made to the other party for written assurance of the intent to perform. In the event that no written assurance is given within the reasonable time specified when demand is made, then and in that event the demanding party may treat such failure as an anticipatory repudiation of this Agreement.

13.0 DEFAULT

If Vendor abandons or defaults under this Agreement, Vendor shall be declared in default of this Agreement if it does any of the following and fails to cure the issue within thirty (30) days of receipt of written notice:

1. Fails to fully, timely and faithfully perform any of its material obligations under this Agreement;
2. Becomes insolvent or seeks relief under the bankruptcy laws of the United States and is unable to perform its material obligations under the Agreement.

14.0 TERMINATION AND SUSPENSION

A. City has the right to terminate this Agreement, in whole or in part, for convenience and without cause, at any time upon written notice to Vendor, the "Date of Termination."

B. In the event of any default by Vendor, City has the right to terminate this Agreement for cause, upon ten (10) days' written notice to Vendor.

C. Vendor has the right to terminate this Agreement only for cause, that being in the event of a material and substantial breach by City, or by mutual agreement to terminate evidenced in writing by and between the parties.

D. In the event City terminates under subsections (A) or (B) of this section, the following shall apply: Upon City's delivery of the referenced notice to Vendor, Vendor shall discontinue all services in connection with the performance of this Agreement and shall proceed to cancel promptly all existing orders and contracts insofar as such orders and contracts are chargeable to this Agreement. Within thirty (30) days after the Date of Termination, Vendor shall submit a statement showing in detail the goods and/or services satisfactorily performed under this Agreement up to the date of termination. City shall then pay Vendor that portion of the charges, if undisputed. The parties agree that Vendor is not entitled to compensation for services it would have performed under the remaining term of the Agreement except as provided herein.

15.0 INDEMNIFICATION

Vendor shall defend (at the option of City), indemnify, and hold City, its successors, assigns, officers, employees and elected officials harmless from and against all suits, actions, legal proceedings, claims, demands, damages, costs, expenses, attorney's fees, and any and all other costs or fees arising out of, or incident to, concerning or resulting from the fault of Vendor, or Vendor's agents, employees or subcontractors, in the performance of Vendor's obligations under this Agreement, no matter how, or to whom, such loss may occur. Nothing herein shall be deemed to limit the rights of City or Vendor (including, but not limited to the right to seek contribution) against any third party who may be liable for an indemnified claim.

16.0 COMPLIANCE WITH LAWS, CHARTER, AND ORDINANCES

A. Vendor, its agents, employees and subcontractors shall use best efforts to comply with all applicable federal and state laws, the Charter and Ordinances of the City of Round Rock, as amended, and with all applicable rules and regulations promulgated by local, state and national boards, bureaus and agencies.

B. In accordance with Chapter 2271, Texas Government Code, a governmental entity may not enter into a contract with a company for goods or services unless the contract contains written verification from the company that it: (1) does not boycott Israel; and (2) will not boycott Israel and will not boycott Israel during the term of this contract. The signatory executing this Agreement on behalf of Vendor verifies Vendor does not boycott Israel and will not boycott Israel during the term of this Agreement.

C. In accordance with Chapter 2274, Texas Government Code, a governmental entity may not enter into a contract with a company with at least ten (10) full-time employees for a value of at least One Hundred Thousand and No/100 Dollars (\$100,000.00) unless the contract has a provision verifying that it: (1) does not have a practice, policy, guidance, or directive that discriminates against a firearm entity or firearm trade association; and (2) will not discriminate during the term of the contract against a firearm entity or firearm trade association. The signatory executing this Agreement on behalf of Vendor verifies Vendor does not have a practice, policy, guidance, or directive that discriminates against a firearm entity or firearm trade association, and it will not discriminate during the term of this Agreement against a firearm entity or firearm trade association.

D. In accordance with Chapter 2274, Texas Government Code, a governmental entity may not enter into a contract with a company with at least ten (10) full-time employees for a value of at least One Hundred Thousand and No/100 Dollars (\$100,000.00) unless the contract has a provision verifying that it: (1) does not boycott energy companies; and (2) will not boycott energy companies during the term of this Agreement. The signatory executing this Agreement on behalf of Vendor verifies Vendor does not boycott energy companies, and it will not boycott energy companies during the term of this Agreement.

17.0 ASSIGNMENT AND DELEGATION

The parties hereby bind themselves, their successors, assigns and legal representatives to each other with respect to the terms of this Agreement. Neither party shall assign, sublet or transfer any interest in this Agreement without prior written authorization of the other party.

18.0 NOTICES

A. All notices and other communications in connection with this Agreement shall be in writing and shall be considered given as follows:

1. When delivered personally to recipient's physical or email address as stated below; or
2. Three (3) days after being deposited in the United States mail, with postage prepaid to the recipient's address as stated below.

Notice to Vendor:

Vendor: MoboTrex, LLC
Address: 109 West 55th Street
Davenport, IA 52806
Email: vholdridge@mobotrex.com

Notice to City:

City Manager
221 East Main Street
Round Rock, TX 78664

AND TO: Stephanie L. Sandre, City Attorney
309 East Main Street
Round Rock, TX 78664

B. Nothing contained herein shall be construed to restrict the transmission of routine communications between representatives of City and Vendor.

19.0 APPLICABLE LAW, ENFORCEMENT, AND VENUE

This Agreement shall be enforceable in Round Rock, Texas, and if legal action is necessary by either party with respect to the enforcement of any or all of the terms or conditions herein, exclusive venue for same shall lie in Williamson County, Texas. This Agreement shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws and court decisions of the State of Texas.

20.0 EXCLUSIVE AGREEMENT

This document, and all appended documents, constitutes the entire Agreement between Vendor and City. This Agreement may only be amended or supplemented by mutual agreement of the parties hereto in writing.

21.0 DISPUTE RESOLUTION

City and Vendor hereby expressly agree that no claims or disputes between the parties arising out of or relating to this Agreement, or a breach thereof shall be decided by any arbitration proceeding, including without limitation, any proceeding under the Federal Arbitration Act (9 USC Section 1-14) or any applicable state arbitration statute.

22.0 SEVERABILITY

The invalidity, illegality, or unenforceability of any provision of this Agreement or the occurrence of any event rendering any portion or provision of this Agreement void shall in no way affect the validity or enforceability of any other portion or provision of this Agreement. Any void provision shall be deemed severed from this Agreement, and the balance of this Agreement shall be construed and enforced as if this Agreement did not contain the particular portion or provision held to be void. The parties further agree to amend this Agreement to replace any stricken provision with a valid provision that comes as close as possible to the intent of the stricken provision. The provisions of this section shall not prevent this entire Agreement from being void should a provision which is of the essence of this Agreement be determined void.

23.0 MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS

A. Standard of Care. Vendor represents that it employs trained, experienced, and competent persons to perform all of the services, responsibilities and duties specified herein and that such services, responsibilities, and duties shall be performed in a manner according to generally accepted industry practices.

B. Time is of the Essence. The parties agree that, from time to time, certain unique transactions may have special requirements relative to timing and, accordingly, the parties will identify those transactions and exercise best efforts to accomplish those transactions within the stated timeframe. Other timing requirements will be met in a commercially reasonable manner. Where damage is caused to City due to Vendor's failure to perform in the special timing requirement circumstances, City may pursue any remedy available without waiver of any of City's additional legal rights or remedies.

C. Binding Agreement. This Agreement shall extend to and be binding upon and inure to the benefit of the parties' respective heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns.

D. Multiple Counterparts. This Agreement may be executed in multiple counterparts, any one of which shall be considered an original of this document; and all of which, when taken together, shall constitute one and the same instrument.

[Signatures on the following page.]

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, City and Vendor have executed this Agreement on the dates indicated.

MoboTrex, LLC

By: 
Printed Name: Vincent Holdridge
Title: Inside Sales Rep
Date Signed: 06/22/2026

City of Round Rock, Texas

By: _____
Printed Name: _____
Title: _____
Date Signed: _____

For City, Attest:

By: _____
Ann Franklin, City Clerk

For City, Approved as to Form:

By: _____
Stephanie L. Sandre, City Attorney

EXHIBIT “A”

1 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies

Discount (%) off catalog/price list for **Traffic Light and Signal Systems, Supplies, and Equipment.**

Catalog/Price list MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.

Total:

Item Notes: **PROPOSAL NOTE:** Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with their Proposal response or the Proposal will not be considered. Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with the Proposal in a readily available and readable electronic format, with Excel or searchable PDF preferred. **No paper catalogs or manufacturer/ vendor websites will be accepted.**

Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or catalog/price list per line item must submit the information as follows or proposal may not be considered:

- Select **"Add Alternate"** for each additional manufacturer product line and/or catalog/price list proposed
- Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each manufacturer and/or catalog/price list listed

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Manufacturer Catalog or Product Price list Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not reference SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

2 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies

Discount (%) off catalog/price list for **Traffic Safety Barrier, Barricade, and Guardrail Products** (Cable, Concrete, Plastic, Steel, Wood, W-Beam, Thri-Beam, End Treatments, Posts, and other related products).

Catalog/Price list MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.

No Bid

Item Notes: **PROPOSAL NOTE:** Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with their Proposal response or the Proposal will not be considered. Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with the Proposal in a readily available and readable electronic format, with Excel or searchable PDF preferred. **No paper catalogs or manufacturer/ vendor websites will be accepted.**

Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or catalog/price list per line item must submit the information as follows or proposal may not be considered:

- Select **"Add Alternate"** for each additional manufacturer product line and/or catalog/price list proposed
- Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each manufacturer and/or catalog/price list listed

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Manufacturer Catalog or Product Price list Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not reference SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

3 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies

Discount (%) off catalog/price list for **Traffic Intersection Safety** (Parking Lot, Pedestrian, Railroad, School Zone) **Equipment and Products**. **Catalog/Price list MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.**

No Bid

Item Notes: **PROPOSAL NOTE:** Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with their Proposal response or the Proposal will not be considered. Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with the Proposal in a readily available and readable electronic format, with Excel or searchable PDF preferred. **No paper catalogs or manufacturer/ vendor websites will be accepted.**

Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or catalog/price list per line item must submit the information as follows or proposal may not be considered:

- Select **"Add Alternate"** for each additional manufacturer product line and/or catalog/price list proposed
- Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each manufacturer and/or catalog/price list listed

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Manufacturer Catalog or Product Price list Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not reference SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

No response

4 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies

Discount (%) off catalog/price list for **Traffic Marker and Sign Products**. **Catalog/Price list MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.**

No Bid

Item Notes: **PROPOSAL NOTE:** Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with their Proposal response or the Proposal will not be considered. Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with the Proposal in a readily available and readable electronic format, with Excel or searchable PDF preferred. **No paper catalogs or manufacturer/ vendor websites will be accepted.**

Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or catalog/price list per line item must submit the information as follows or proposal may not be considered:

- Select **"Add Alternate"** for each additional manufacturer product line and/or catalog/price list proposed
- Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each manufacturer and/or catalog/price list listed

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Manufacturer Catalog or Product Price list Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not reference SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

No response

5 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies

Discount (%) off catalog/price list for **Computerized Traffic Design Plans, Traffic Flagging, and Special Event Services**. **Catalog/Price list MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.**

No Bid

Item Notes: **PROPOSAL NOTE:** Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with their Proposal response or the Proposal will not be considered. Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with the Proposal in a readily available and readable electronic format, with Excel or searchable PDF preferred. **No paper catalogs or manufacturer/ vendor websites will be accepted.**

Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or catalog/price list per line item must submit the information as follows or proposal may not be considered:

- Select **"Add Alternate"** for each additional manufacturer product line and/or catalog/price list proposed
- Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each manufacturer and/or catalog/price list listed

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Manufacturer Catalog or Product Price list Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not reference SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

No response

6 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies

Discount (%) off catalog/price list for **All Other Traffic Light and Signal System Products**. **Catalog/Price list MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.**

No Bid

Item Notes: **PROPOSAL NOTE:** Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with their Proposal response or the Proposal will not be considered. Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with the Proposal in a readily available and readable electronic format, with Excel or searchable PDF preferred. **No paper catalogs or manufacturer/ vendor websites will be accepted.**

Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or catalog/price list per line item must submit the information as follows or proposal may not be considered:

- Select **"Add Alternate"** for each additional manufacturer product line and/or catalog/price list proposed
- Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each manufacturer and/or catalog/price list listed

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Manufacturer Catalog or Product Price list Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not reference SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

No response

7 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies

Discount (%) off catalog/price list for **Traffic Light and Signal Systems Repair Parts**. **Catalog/Price list MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.**

No Bid

Item Notes: **PROPOSAL NOTE:** Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with their Proposal response or the Proposal will not be considered. Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with the Proposal in a readily available and readable electronic format, with Excel or searchable PDF preferred. **No paper catalogs or manufacturer/ vendor websites will be accepted.**

Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or catalog/price list per line item must submit the information as follows or proposal may not be considered:

- Select **"Add Alternate"** for each additional manufacturer product line and/or catalog/price list proposed
- Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each manufacturer and/or catalog/price list listed

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Manufacturer Catalog or Product Price list Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not reference SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

No response

8 Section I: Equipment, Products, and Supplies

Discount (%) off catalog/price list for **Traffic Light and Signal Equipment and Products Maintenance/Warranty Agreements**. **Catalog/Price list MUST be included or proposal will not be considered.**

No Bid

Item Notes: **PROPOSAL NOTE:** Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with their Proposal response or the Proposal will not be considered. Vendors shall submit catalog(s)/pricelist(s) with the Proposal in a readily available and readable electronic format, with Excel or searchable PDF preferred. **No paper catalogs or manufacturer/ vendor websites will be accepted.**

Vendors proposing multiple manufacturer product lines and/or catalog/price list per line item must submit the information as follows or proposal may not be considered:

- Select **"Add Alternate"** for each additional manufacturer product line and/or catalog/price list proposed
- Vendor's must list one specific percentage discount for each manufacturer and/or catalog/price list listed

Item Attributes

1. State Name of Manufacturer Catalog or Product Price list Proposed with Discount Percentage

NOTE: Do not reference SKU, Reference Numbers, Websites, and/or "See Attached/Enclosed".

No response

9 Section II: Installation and Repair Service

Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Traffic Signal Systems, Products, and Related Items – Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of Traffic Signal Systems, Equipment, and Products.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hourly Labor Rate

No Bid

1
0

Section II: Installation and Repair Service

Hourly Labor Rate for Installation/Repair Service of Traffic Safety Barrier, Barricade, and Guardrail Products, and Related Items - Not to Exceed hourly labor rate for Installation/Repair Service of Traffic Safety Barrier, Barricade, and Guardrail Products.

Quantity: 1 UOM: Hourly Labor Rate

No Bid

Response Total: \$0.00

Buyboard
Specification

Item No.	Category	Part/Item Number	Item Description	MSRP/List Price
1		100102001	FAN&THERMO KIT NEMA	\$74.81
1		2562101213	CABINET,TS2,5116,TX04,712TX2,NO PT,PLUG	\$14,789.29
1		0812-02	SKY BRAC:OLSON J-PIPE,CAMERA MT	\$152.66
1		10W1-10106	NEMA 5-15P 18AWG 6ft Cord to Bare Wires	\$8.89
1		2018KCLIP	MONTR, CONFL 18CH 2018KCLIP	\$787.88
1		A70012003	VISOR: 12",POLY,TNL,GLBLK	\$6.43
1		A70012004	VISOR: 12",POLY,TNL,YLW/FLBLK	\$10.72
1		AB-2003-46-PNC	AB-2003-46-PNC	\$57.82
1		AB-2003-74-PNC	GUSSETED TUBE W/ INSERT	\$87.88
1		AMU214	MONTR, AUX ITS CABINET	\$240.98
1		ANT-2012GN-SFP-T	20port, Ind Gb ManagedSw,8RJ45,12SFP,EOT	\$2,954.07
1		ANT-LMX-0804G-SFP-T	8port, Ind Managed Sw, 4RJ45-GB, 4SPF-GB	\$1,632.59
1		ANT-LNX-0702C-SFP-T	7port Ind Unmanaged Sw, 5RJ45, 2SFP-GB	\$419.26
1		ANT-LNX-0702G-SFP-T	SWITCH,7 PORT,UNMANAGED,5* RJ45,2*SFP	\$400.00
1		ANT-LNX-0802C-SFP	Ind Eth sw, 6xRJ45,2xGb sfp	\$570.37
1		ANT-LNX-0802C-SFP-T	8port, Ind Unmanaged Sw, 6RJ45,2SFP,EOT	\$629.63
1		ANT-SFP-100M-T	SFP, 100Mb, MM, LC, 2km, 1310nm, EOT	\$72.59
1		ANT-SFP-100S20-T	SFP, 100Mb, SMFO, LC, 20km, 1310nm, EOT	\$81.48
1		ANT-SFP-M2-T	SFP, 1Gb, MMFO, LC, 2km, 1310nm, EOT	\$91.85
1		ANT-SFP-S10	Gigabit SFP Transcvr, SM 10km, LC,1310nm	\$44.44
1		ANT-SFP-S10-T	SFP, 1Gb, SMFO, LC, 10km, 1310nm, EOT	\$34.07
1		ANT-SFP-S20-T	SFP, 1Gb, SMFO, LC, 20km, 1310nm, EOT	\$125.93
1		AP-0109-PNC	POLE CAP 11-1/4" w/set screws	\$89.47
1		AQC11186-005	RISER BASE: "P" RISER BASE, 8"	\$295.71
1		AQC11186P001	RISER BASE:12Hx44Wx25.5D, P-CAB	\$342.20
1		AQC11186P002	RISER BASE,15Hx44Wx25.5D,P-CAB	\$357.14
1		AQC11186P003	RISER BASE:18Hx44Wx25.5D,P-CAB	\$407.19
1		AQC11268P003	RISER BASE:12Hx36Wx17,M36,CAB	\$261.62
1		AQC11498P001	RISER BASE:15Hx30Wx17D,M-CAB	\$246.61
1		AQC12242P001	RISER BASE: 12"H, CONT WELD,P-CAB	\$468.76
1		AQC14844P001	RISER BASE: 8"H, FOR 332CAB	\$268.24
1		AQC14844P002	332 RISER BASE 12"H	\$299.12
1		BIU200	BUS INTERFACE UNIT BIU700	\$266.71
1		BPA503ANL	BP,3-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR	\$60.56
1		BPA503ANL002E0-00	BP,3-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR,	\$63.42
1		BPA504ANL	BP,4-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR	\$99.43
1		BPA505ANL	BP,5-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR	\$102.42
1		BPA505ANL002E0-00	BP,5-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR	\$100.32
1		BPAR502ANL002E0-00	BP,2-S,12",ALUM,LVR,2" REFLECTIVE TAPE	\$87.69
1		BPAR503ANF002E	BP,3-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,FLAT,2"	\$93.56

1	BPAR503ANL002E	BP,3-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR,	\$102.91
1	BPAR503ANL002E0-00	BP,3-S,12", ALUM, LVR, 2" REFL TAPE	\$102.34
1	BPAR503TNL023E0-00	BP,3-S,HAWK,ALUM,12", 3"REF TAPE,17"CTC	\$254.64
1	BPAR503TNL041E3-00	BP,3-S,HAWK,,ALUM 1"REF TAPE, SE-5059	\$188.82
1	BPAR503TNL042E3-00	BP,3-S,HAWK,,ALUM 2"REF TAPE,SE-5059 OH	\$203.17
1	BPAR504AEL002E0-00	BP,4-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR,2"	\$138.37
1	BPAR504ANF002E0-00	BP,4-S,12", W/2" ON TAPE OUTER EDGE	\$136.27
1	BPAR504ANL002E0-00	BP,4-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR,2"	\$124.64
1	BPAR505ANF002E	BP,5-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,FLAT,2"	\$131.60
1	BPAR505ANL002E0-00	ALUM BP FOR 5 SECT 12" SG SIGNAL	\$143.32
1	BPAR505HNL002E0-00	BP, 5-CL,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,	\$168.56
1	BPC503AEL	BP,3-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR,	\$81.95
1	BPC503ANF	BP,3-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,FLAT	\$58.20
1	BPC503ANL	BP,3-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR	\$67.65
1	BPC504AEL	12" 4 SECT BP W/ELEVATED PLUMB	\$106.04
1	BPC504ANF	BP,4-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,FLAT	\$92.40
1	BPC504ANL	BP,4-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR	\$100.46
1	BPC505ANL	BP,5-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,LVR	\$102.54
1	BPC505HNF010N0-00	BP,5-CL,12",ALUM,5"BRDR	\$132.41
1	BPCR503ANF002E	12" 3 SECT B/P W/2" REFLECTIVE	\$92.23
1	BPCR503ANL002E	BP,3-S,12",ALUM, W/BRDR,2" REFL TAPE	\$101.49
1	BPCR504ANF002E	BP,4S,12", ALUM W/2" REF TAPE	\$129.07
1	BPCR504ANL002E0-00	BP, 4-S,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,2" REFL TAPE	\$126.75
1	BPCR505ANF002E0-00	BP,5-CL,12",ALUM,5"BRDR,FLAT,2" REFL	\$137.72
1	BPCR505ANL002E	BP:5S,12",ALUM,2" REFL TAPE	\$143.20
1	BPDR504ANF002E0-00	BP,4-S,12",SAP,POLY,2" REFL TAPE	\$112.98
1	BVDR503ANF002E0-00	BP,3S,12",SAP,5"BRDR,VAC,2" REFLECTIVE	\$88.18
1	BVDR504ANF002E0-00	B/P,VAC FRMD,4S,12",SA,2"REFL	\$102.41
1	CAR-46673	TOP:2W,4-4.5"OD,SLIP FITTER,YLW	\$161.62
1	CAR-49676	SIG HEAD:12"POLY,VISOR,YLW	\$144.30
1	CAR-67620	BATTERY:7A/HR,STAND,(E SERIES)	\$47.62
1	CAR-R247-MX100	Carmanah 247-MX100 (one-way, no pole)	\$2,722.22
1	CAR-R829-MX100	Carmanah R829-MX100 (one-way, no pole)	\$3,344.16
1	CAR-R829-MX300	Carmanah R829-MX300 (one-way, no pole)	\$3,833.33
1	CAR-R920-MX100	Carmanah R920-MX100 RRFB (one-way, no pole)	\$3,944.44
1	CAR-R920-MX300	Carmanah R920-MX300 RRFB (one-way, no pole)	\$4,360.75
1	CAR-R920-MX300-OHL	Carmanah R920-MX300-OHL RRFB (two-way, no pole)	\$5,210.68
1	CAR-SC315-G	Carmanah SC315-G (one-way, no pole)	\$5,388.89
1	CMU212	MONTR, UNIT CABINET	\$489.18
1	COM-32112-5	XT 24VDC Power Supply- PULS ML60.243	\$253.33
1	CPS105	CABINET POWER SUPPLY: 5 AMP	\$256.85
1	EBE-206L	High Efficiency Power Supply	\$305.34
1	EBE-210E PROGRAM CARD	PROGRAM CARD, 2010ECL	\$36.08
1	EBE-242L	ISOLTR, DC, 2CH, 242L, 2009 Caltrans TEE	\$40.12

1	EBE-MMU2-16LE	TS-2 MUU SMART MON W/FL YEL	\$707.07
1	EBE-MMU2-16LEip	TS2 MMU SMART MON & IP W/FL YL	\$1,277.37
1	EBE-MONITORKEY-USB	CMU DATA KEY PROGRAMMER	\$431.46
1	EL762TX1	CABINET, BBS,NO GEN COMP,TXDOT	\$1,370.84
1	EL762TX3	CABINET, G,BBS,GEN COMP	\$1,670.86
1	FRE-63DM	Damper Mount (Does Not Include Damper Vo	\$718.76
1	FRE-CP6	Crosswalk Pedestal Base, Cover, and Hard	\$333.29
1	FRE-CP64840TCSS	Crosswalk Pedestal Base, Cover, Pipe, Ca	\$523.92
1	FRE-CP6A	Crosswalk Pedestal Base, Cover, Anchors,	\$384.24
1	FRE-CP6ACT4840TCSS	Crosswalk Ped Base,Cover,Anchors,pole	\$717.76
1	FRE-CP6ACT4840TCSS-NF	Crosswalk Pedestal Base, Cover, Anchors,	\$566.57
1	FRE-CP6ACTTCSS	Crosswalk Pedestal Base, Cover, Anchors,	\$455.27
1	FRE-CP6A-NF	Crosswalk Pedestal Base, Cover, Anchors,	\$258.83
1	FRE-CP6H4840TCSS-M	Pedestal Base+Cover+Anchors,X-walk,hilti	\$647.29
1	FRE-CP6-NF	Crosswalk Pedestal Base, Cover and Hard	\$207.88
1	FRE-TCSS-NF	Pole cap w/ set screws, no finish	\$31.90
1	HT2000	FLSHR, 810 15A	\$32.96
1	ICR-3241W-1SWH	NAM:FIRSTNET,CAT4,2xETH,RS232,RS485,GPS	\$1,544.16
1	ITE-CAMBRKT4	Camera Mtg Bkt, Universal Pedestal	\$172.84
1	ITE-NEXT-CAM-PAK	Next WDR Cam & VERT BRAC,RJ45 CONN(x2)	\$1,461.11
1	ITE-NEXT-CAT5E-SHLD-CABLE	VantageNext 1000ft Box, outdoor, UV re	\$427.78
1	ITE-NEXT-CCU-SM2-TS2-PAK	Next CCU Unit, Shelf Mt, TS2, 2-Sensors	\$8,301.23
1	ITE-NEXT-CCU-SM4-TS2-PAK	Next CCU Unit, Shelf Mt, TS2, 4-Sensors	\$9,988.89
1	ITE-NEXT-DVP-PAK	VantageNext 2-Camera Video DVP Card	\$4,630.86
1	ITE-NEXT-RAD-SURGE-4	4-Sensor Surge Protector - NEXT & RADIUS	\$686.42
1	ITE-NEXT-VECTOR-NEXT	VantageNext Vector Sensor Unit	\$4,444.44
1	ITE-RAD-CCU-PAK	VantageRadius CCU Unit w/CCU shipkit	\$3,908.64
1	ITE-RAD-PROC-PAK	VantageRadius Dual Proc w/Proc shipkit	\$4,528.40
1	ITE-RAD-SENSOR-PAK	VantageRadius Sensor Unit	\$3,271.60
1	ITE-SPM-10-10YR	SIGNAL PERFORMANCE MEASURE, 10YR LIC	\$2,266.67
1	ITE-VEL-ANT-SH-BKT	Velocity Antenna w/9" cabinet mount	\$333.33
1	ITE-VELOCITY-SM	Shelf Mount Field Unit w/Ethernet Conn.	\$3,869.14
1	LT2000	SWITCH: LD 510 10A RMS -34+74C	\$31.75
1	MK-8A30 HEI	BATTERY:12V,105A,AGM VRLA SEALED,C	\$331.89
1	MMU16-EXTCARD	MMU TEST CARD	\$247.33
1	MMU16LE-PGM CARD	PROGRAM CARD FOR SMART MONITOR	\$77.92
1	MYERS-AP9930-48-3854	BATTERY MGR:48V,ICBM,1STRING,72"CBL	\$316.02
1	MYERS-CAB-739575M	CABLE:10',48V,BATTERY CBLs	\$115.44
1	MYERS-TAB-722506	19" EIA Mounting Ears for Inverter	\$18.76
1	PAD11697-001	APEX HYBRID CAMERA/RADAR SENSOR - 3 WIRE	\$6,055.56
1	PAF13154-001	PROTECTOR:SURGE,POE ENET,DIN MOUNTABLE	\$182.78
1	PAJ13316-001	CONTROLLER:RVC KIT,MODULE W/PWR SUPPLY	\$22,000.00
1	PAR05883P001	204 Flasher for CALTRANS	\$26.33
1	PAR09556-001	ATC: LOADSWITCH / FLASHER, 2202HV	\$199.13

1	PAR09556-002	ATCC 2202LV LOADSWITCH / FLASHER	\$171.72
1	PAR335	RELAY:FLASH TRANSFER,30A,120VAC	\$28.12
1	PAS10271-002	NAM:FIRSTNET,CAT4,2xETH,RS232,RS485,WiFi	\$1,544.16
1	PAS11214-001	TRACKER 24.125 GHz,TRAF COLECT RADAR,GPS	\$3,888.89
1	PAS11214-002	WEATHERPROOF RUGGED CARRYING CASE	\$307.36
1	PAS11214-004	TRACKER 24.125 GHz,TRAF COLECT RADAR	\$3,522.37
1	PAS11214-008	ArmadilloDC TRACKER OPT,BLUTOOTH FOR iOS	\$422.80
1	PAS11529-001	ETHERNET SWITCH,UNMANAGED,12 RJ45,4 SFP	\$909.63
1	PAS11590	ANTAIRA LMX1204G-SFP-T (4SFP,8ETH)SWITCH	\$1,254.81
1	PAS11663-001	SWITCH,20 PORT,L3,MGD,8*RJ45,12*SFP	\$1,857.78
1	PAS11724-001	SWITCH:10 PORT, PoE,L3,MANAGED,ETHERNET	\$1,103.70
1	PAS11725-001	SWITCH:12 PORT, PoE,L3,MANAGED,ETHERNET	\$1,597.04
1	PAS11756-001	SWITCH:12 PORT,IEEE,L3,MANAGED,ETHERNET	\$1,900.74
1	PAS11756-002	SWTCH:12PORT,IEEE,L3,MNGED,ETHER,W/BOSCH	\$1,900.74
1	PAS11758-001	SWITCH:12 PORT, PoE,L3,MANAGED,ETHERNET	\$1,343.70
1	PAS11800	INDUSTRIAL 802.3at GB POE INJECTOR EOT	\$211.85
1	PAS11804-001	SWITCH,20 PORT,L3,MGD,16*RJ45,4*SFP	\$1,776.30
1	PAS11810	9 Port Managed PoE+ Switch	\$1,293.33
1	PAS11831	8 PORT POE++ MANAGED 90W/PORT	\$1,540.74
1	PAS11907-001	CELL ROUTER W/FIRMWARE 6.3.2,USER MODS	\$21.65
1	PAS11957	11 PORT MANAGED SWITCH w/8 ETH + 2 SFP	\$968.89
1	PAS11958	33 PORT RACK MOUNT SWITCH,4 RJ45, 24SFP	\$1,637.04
1	PAS12003	GB ETH TO GB FIBER MEDIA CONVERTER	\$220.74
1	PAS12058-001	SWITCH:8 PORT,UNMANAGED,RJ45,ETHERNET	\$293.33
1	PAS12060	6PORT UNMANAGED SWITCH 4ETH, 2 SC SM	\$380.74
1	PAS12089	7 PORT UNMANGD SWITCH w/2 100 SC MM 2KM	\$315.56
1	PAS12127-001	SWITCH:10 PORT,PoE,UNMANAGED,ETHERNET,CC	\$917.04
1	PAS12189-001	SWITCH,12 PORT,L3,MGD,8*RJ45,4*SFP,CC	\$1,411.85
1	PAS12190-001	SWITCH,32 PORT,MGD,4*RJ45,4*SFP,AC,DC	\$1,845.93
1	PAS12196-001	MEDIA CONVERTER,10/100/1000TX,W/SFP SLOT	\$91.85
1	PAS13590-001	SWITCH,7 PORT GIGABIT PoE, ENET,12~55VDC	\$804.44
1	PAS13674-001	SWITCH,7 PORT GIGABIT PoE, ENET,12~55VDC	\$1,543.70
1	PAS13898-001	16-Port Industrial Gigabit IEEE 802.3bt PoE++	\$4,995.56
1	PAV6	FAN,4X4,100CFM, 120VAC	\$15.80
1	PAX10943-001	OPTICAL SIGNAL PROCESSOR -4 CHANNEL	\$2,649.97
1	PAX10943-002	OPTICAL SIGNAL PROCESSOR -2 CHANNEL	\$1,882.14
1	PBB10691-001	BATTERY:17.2A/Hr,STANDARD(F SERIES)	\$118.33
1	PBB10833-001	BATTERY:55 AHR,STANDARD	\$282.83
1	PBB10887-001	EXTERNAL BATTERY BALANCER	\$66.23
1	PBB13318-001	BATTERY:100 AH 12V,DEEP CYCLE,13"x7"x9"	\$875.45
1	PBL07466-001	LED,12",BALL,RED,TINT	\$37.04
1	PBL07466-003	LED,12",BALL,RED,TINT,15 YR WNTY	\$46.93
1	PBL07466-004	LED,12",BALL,RED,CLEAR,15 YR WNTY	\$40.87
1	PBL07467-001	LED,12",BALL,YEL,TINT	\$61.30

1	PBL07467-002	LED,12",BALL,YEL,CLEAR	\$68.01
1	PBL07467-003	LED,12",BALL,YEL,TINT,15 YR WNTY	\$51.09
1	PBL07468-001	LED,12",BALL,GRN,TINT	\$66.41
1	PBL07468-002	LED,12",BALL,GRN,CLEAR	\$73.75
1	PBL07468-003	LED,12",BALL,GRN,TINT,15 YR WNTY	\$47.89
1	PBL07469-001	LED,12",ARROW,RED,TINT	\$45.98
1	PBL07469-002	LED,12",ARROW,RED,CLEAR	\$51.09
1	PBL07469-003	LED,12",ARROW,RED,TINT,15 YR WNTY	\$51.72
1	PBL07469-004	LED,12",ARROW,RED,CLEAR,15 YR WNTY	\$40.87
1	PBL07470-001	LED,12",ARROW,YEL,TINT	\$54.92
1	PBL07470-002	LED,12",ARROW,YEL,CLEAR	\$60.98
1	PBL07470-003	LED,12",ARROW,YEL,TINT,15 YR WNTY	\$55.56
1	PBL07470-004	LED,12",ARROW,YEL,CLEAR,15 YR WNTY	\$43.42
1	PBL07471-001	LED,12",ARROW,GRN,TINT	\$58.75
1	PBL07471-002	LED,12",ARROW,GRN,CLEAR	\$65.13
1	PBL07471-003	LED,12",ARROW,GRN,TINT,15 YR WNTY	\$53.00
1	PBL07473-003	LED,12",ARROW,GRN,CLEAR,15 YR WNTY	\$53.00
1	PBL07856-001	LED,16",PED,HAND/MAN,CD	\$127.95
1	PBL08529-001	LED,12",BALL,RED,TINT,12VDC	\$75.61
1	PBL08530-001	LED,12",BALL,GRN,TINT,12VDC	\$78.67
1	PBL08532-001	LED,12",BALL,YEL,TINT,12VDC	\$89.14
1	PBL08673-001	LIGHTBAR: CONFIRMATION(BOTH ENDS),BLK	\$702.74
1	PBL08713-002	LED,12",BALL,YEL,CLEAR,15 YR WNTY	\$51.09
1	PBL09241-001	STROBE LAMP,TOMAR 3065-R EMITTER	\$65.19
1	PBU12331-001	EXT WARRANTY,PER YR,UP TO 4 YR,5 YR TOT	\$1,587.95
1	PBU12575-001	SOFTWARE:MX PRO SUBSCRIPTION,1 YR.	\$225.85
1	PBU12637-001	SOFTWARE:MX PRO SUBSCRIPTION,5 YRS.	\$1,128.02
1	PBU12651-001	DATA PLAN:CELL MODEM SIM,PER RADAR,1YR	\$864.36
1	PBU13257-001	SOFTWARE:MX PRO SUBSCRIPTION,3 YR.	\$676.33
1	PBV12182-001	TRAFFIC COUNTER KIT,ARMADILLO CROSSFIRE	\$3,437.23
1	PBW10253-001	CBL KIT:300V,UL SVT,DC/DC & AC/DC	\$21.65
1	PBW10886-002	BATTERY HARNESS F/1.5KVA	\$142.21
1	PBW10886-003	BATTERY HARNESS F/EP-2200 UPS	\$200.79
1	PBW10886-004	BATTERY HARNESS F/EP-1100 UPS	\$205.96
1	PBW10949-001	TS2 SDLC CBL,8 ft.,DB15-DB15 CONN W/LCKS	\$37.65
1	PBW11732-001	SPEEDLANE PRO MULTI-CONNECTOR CABLE,40'	\$184.70
1	PBW13317-001	CABLE:PLC 600V,18/3C IMPEDEANCE,500 FT	\$569.99
1	PBW13431-001	CABLE:6 FT.USB-C TO RS232 RJ45 CONSOLE	\$59.26
1	PBW13607-001	CABLE:SPEEDLANE PRO,30.48m,RS232,100' LG	\$369.41
1	PBW13877-001	CABLE ASSY:4',SDLC2 2070 CTRL,4930241014	\$61.73
1	PBW13878-001	CABLE ASSEMBLY:SDLC SPLITTER	\$37.04
1	PBW13882-001	CBL:14"SPEEDLANE,RJ45-IP67 RJ45 CPLR,BKT	\$92.35
1	PBW13931-001	CABLE:SDLC OUTPUT FOR TS2,DB25 TO DB15	\$166.67
1	PBX09893	1000Base-LX Single-Mode SFP module, 10km, -40~85C	\$76.91

1	PBX09927-001	1000Base-SX Multi-Mode SFP module, 550m, -40~85C	\$50.51
1	PBX11665-001	SFP,1.3GB,WDM-A,SM/10KM/LC,T/R:1310/1551	\$37.04
1	PBX11666-001	SFP,1.3GB,WDM-B,SM/10KM/LC,T/R:1550/1311	\$40.00
1	PBX11704	1000Base-LX Single-Mode SFP module, 40km, -40~85C	\$327.27
1	PBX11733	Serial To MM Fiber Ports Converter	\$414.81
1	PBX11959	10/100/1000BASE-T Copper Ethernet SFP	\$69.63
1	PBX12154-001	SFP,ETHERNET,1.25GB,SM/40KM/LC/1310nm	\$41.48
1	PBX13669-001	RADIO MODULE,IP67,ANT WI-FI 6,BRIDGE RTR	\$1,053.33
1	PCT100TX	TERMINAL BLOCK: 6POS,2R, TX (lettered)	\$3.47
1	PCT13267-001	TERM BLK:02 POS,FEMALE SOCKET,0.138"	\$7.22
1	PCV13932-001	CELLULAR SERVICE,CELL ROUTER,1 YR SERV	\$377.78
1	PDC13951-001	SDLC ADAPTER - DB15 CONNECTOR	\$865.80
1	PDM11430-001	CELLULAR MODEM W/GPS,BUILT-IN PENTA BAND	\$519.48
1	PDM11430-002	RADAR,SPEEDLANE PRO,DUAL BEAM,SIDE-FIRE	\$5,985.57
1	PDM11430-003	SPEEDLANE OPTION,ETHERNET CONNECTIVITY	\$767.68
1	PEL-AB-4005-ALO	ARM KIT:8.5",1W,SS,SLOT WSHR,ALU,PNC	\$37.16
1	PEL-AS-0175-74-96-PNC	Astro-Brac Camera Bracket, 1-Piece Adjus	\$238.89
1	PEL-AS-3009-62	CLAMP KIT:STELLAR,w/62"GALV,CBL MT,PNC	\$114.98
1	PEL-PB-5100-04-PNC	4 Ft. Aluminum Pole - Schedule 40 - 4.5"	\$121.88
1	PEL-PB-5102-13-NC	POLE:13',SCH80,4-8"NPT,ALU,PNC	\$649.35
1	PEL-PB-5102-18-NC	18' Sch. 80 Spun Alum. 4 1/2" Pedestal P	\$865.80
1	PEL-PB-5334-GL-PNC	Square Aluminum Base w/alum.door and gro	\$226.35
1	PEL-PB-5335-NL-GL-PNC	Base Assy, Square w/ Plastic Door w/o L	\$228.06
1	PEL-PB-5364-GALV	Foundation Anchor Assembly. 4" x 56" w/h	\$596.03
1	PEL-PB-5401-ALO	Acorn pole cap, alodine	\$23.48
1	PEL-PB-5534-GALV	Foundation Anchor 8" Sch 20 11" to 17" B	\$944.01
1	PEL-SE-0436-12-PNC	Nipple, 1-1/2", NPS x 12" Alum.	\$15.87
1	PFB10848-002	DIN RAIL: A/D 100-240V 120W 24V	\$187.59
1	PFP09555-001	ADU, CMU AUX DISPLAY UNIT,19" RACK MT	\$468.98
1	PHL09494-002	EMITTER,OPTICOM,PGM,CODED,HAND-HELD	\$1,263.59
1	PHN12868-001	CAB:24X53,BBS 245319,1 FIX & 2 ADJ SHELF	\$2,470.90
1	PHO13394-001	SERVER:TETRYON CLOUD HOST,PER RADAR/YEAR	\$848.48
1	PIA08960-001	Opt Signal Processor,model OSPOC,4 Chan	\$2,308.80
1	PIA09218-001	PROCESSOR,OPT SIG,2CH	\$1,487.40
1	PIA09219-001	PROCESSOR,OPT SIG,2CH,DETOC	\$1,487.40
1	PIA09221-001	PROCESSOR,OPT SIG,4CH	\$656.57
1	PMD11390-001	BUILT-IN PENTA BAND CELL MODEM W/ GPS	\$920.63
1	PMD13770-001	ROUTER SINGLE LTE WIFI FIRST NET READY	\$2,040.00
1	PMR07804-001	COLLAR ASSY:SQ BASE,ALU,PNC	\$95.35
1	PMR07945-001	ARM KIT:8.5",1W,SS,SLOT WSHR,ALU,PNC	\$60.61
1	PMR08197-001	KIT:SIGNAL CLOSURE,YELLOW	\$2.34
1	PMR08323-001	BASE ASSY: SQUARE, ALUM, W/PLASTIC DOOR	\$219.70
1	PMR08432-001	CAP ASSY:4.5"OD,DOME,ALUM,PNC	\$18.73
1	PMR08537-002	POLE:15FT,ALUM,BARE,PELCO	\$735.93

1	PMR08537-003	POLE:20',SCH80,4-8"NPT,TOE,ALU,PNC	\$995.82
1	PMR08537-009	POLE:17FT,ALUM,PELCO,NAT	\$772.73
1	PMR08538-001	BASE,CAST IRON, GALVANIZED	\$507.94
1	PMR08608-001	CLAMP KIT:STELLAR,84"GALV CBL,MT,ALU,PNC	\$119.77
1	PMR08634-001	ADAPTER:SPAN WIRE,w/SS BUSHINGS,PNC	\$20.38
1	PMR08906-001	PELCO ASTRO BRKT CLMP KIT,120" Cable Mnt	\$118.33
1	PMR09227-001	DAMPER MOUNT W/PLATE,18"x54"x.080",ALU	\$860.94
1	PMR09354-002	CROSSWALK,PED BASE,CVR,CABLE,NATURAL	\$499.77
1	PMR09453-001	Pedstl base,xwlk,cvr,anchors,60" cable	\$579.97
1	PMR09485-001	Pedest base,xwlk,cvr,hw,48",nf	\$465.40
1	PMR09655-001	BASE,SQ,ALU,PL DOOR,GRN LUG,NAT	\$233.85
1	PMR09665-003	ASTRO BRAC:1W,5S,ALU,96"CBL,GALV,PNC	\$231.28
1	PMR10226-002	ASTRO BRAC:1W,3S,ALUM,120"GALV-CBL,PNC	\$235.73
1	PMR10431-001	MINI BRAC:1-1.5",NPS,45"CBL,ALU,PNC	\$44.73
1	PMR10460-002	BP:12",3S,AEROFLEX,UNIV,2" REFLT TAPE	\$114.65
1	PMR10493-001	ASTROBRAC:1W,4S,144"GALV CBL,ALU,PNC	\$268.69
1	PMR10511-001	ASTROBRAC:1W,3S,ALU,144"CBL,GALV,PNC	\$184.34
1	PMR10569-001	HANGER:CLEVIS,.5x.5",SB,GALV PINS,PNC	\$27.20
1	PMR10693-001	POLE CAP ASSY:10.25",w/SET SCRWB,ALU,PNC	\$44.73
1	PMR10693-003	POLE CAP ASSY:9-1/4",ALUM,PNC	\$43.29
1	PMR10768-001	MOUNT:120",PENDANT,SS CBL & HW,J-PIPE	\$279.71
1	PMR11241-001	4 SECTION HORZ SIGNAL MOUNT, 66" CABLES	\$176.55
1	PMR11276-001	RACK MTG BRKT, 3RU, KIT, BLACK	\$24.26
1	PMR11670-001	MOUNT ADAPTER,DIN-RAIL TO 19" RACK,2U	\$75.56
1	PMR11892-001	4090 and DETOC mast arm mounting kit 3/4"-14NPT	\$73.78
1	PMR12205-001	SIG HEAD BRKT KIT,3S,90" CABLE,46" TUBE	\$198.12
1	PMR12391-001	OLSON ADJ CAM MT,66" SS CBL,74" TUBE	\$240.55
1	PMR12576-001	PMR12576-001	\$306.55
1	PMR13227-001	PIPE:1-1/2",SCH 40,84"LG,NO THREADS,ALUM	\$63.64
1	PMR13438-001	ASTROBRAC ASY:4 SEC,120" GALV CBL,ALU,H/W	\$239.39
1	PMR13443-001	SKY-BRAC,ARTICULATING,CLAMP,66" SS CABLE	\$209.00
1	PMR13444-001	ADAPTER:3/4" CLEVIS,1 1/2" NPS,ALUM	\$43.29
1	PMR13472-001	CLAMP KIT:ASTRO-BRAC,220" CBL MNT,GALV	\$146.70
1	PMR13731-001	SIGN KIT:66" SS CBL,24" CTC TUBE, SS H/W	\$199.52
1	PMR14024-001	BRKT:CAMERA MNT,48" CANE,ASTROBRAC CLAMP	\$729.17
1	PNC7	THERMOSTAT	\$39.68
1	PNE12181-001	TETRYON SERVER ACTIVATION A-LA-CARTE	\$720.06
1	PNT10847-002	ANTENNA,3in1,LTE,MIMO,GPS,3M	\$275.22
1	PPM10576-002	BP:12",4S,AEROFLEX,UNIV,2" REFLT TAPE	\$138.10
1	PPM11717-001	BP: AEROFLEX, 5S PVC, 2" REFL TAPE, PNC	\$190.19
1	PPM11912-001	Backplate, AeroFlex w/ 2" Reflective Tape, 4-Sec Straight, Eagle S	\$156.85
1	PPM13167-001	AEROFLEX,12" 3SEC VERT, EGL SG, 3" RFL TP	\$173.30
1	PPM13169-001	AEROFLEX, 12" 5SEC VERT,EGL SG, 3" RFL TP	\$203.46
1	PPM13802-001	AEROFLEX,12" 3SEC VERT, EGL SA, 3" RFL TP	\$167.06

1	PPM13803-001	Backplate, AeroFlex w/ 2" Reflective Tape, 3-Sec Straight, Econoli	\$167.06
1	PPM13804-001	Backplate, AeroFlex w/ 2" Reflective Tape, 5-Sec Straight, Econoli	\$195.45
1	PPS07929-001	POWER SUPPLY:3A 24VDC/.25A12VAC,5A 12VDC	\$418.47
1	PPS08104-001	P/S 24VDC ITS	\$642.14
1	PPS09554-001	PWR SUPPLY, 48VDC, 24VDC 19" RACK MOUNT	\$411.26
1	PPS09554-002	POWER SUPPLY:48VDC,8A,ATC CAB	\$467.53
1	PPS09554-003	ATCC CAB PWR SUPPLY,48VDC@1A,24&12VDC@5A	\$512.27
1	PPS09610-001	20W SINGLE OUTPUT INDUST DIN RAIL PS 24V	\$20.00
1	PPS11389-001	SOLAR POWER KIT, 5 WATT, CONNECTOR INCLD	\$624.82
1	PPS11548	Antaira 15W DINRAIL Power Supply 24VDC	\$29.63
1	PPS11592	Antaira MDR-40w-48VDC Power Supply	\$62.22
1	PPS11669-001	POWER SUPPLY, 48V,1.25A,60W,US/P1J PLUG	\$59.11
1	PPS11703	ANTAIRA MDR-60-24 60 Watts/24 VDC/2.50A	\$62.22
1	PPS11734	ANTAIRA 10W 24 VDC POWER SUPPLY	\$41.48
1	PPS11743	Antaira 30 Watt / 24 VDC Power Supply	\$38.52
1	PPS11759-001	POWER SUPPLY,2.5A,120W,US PLUG	\$120.00
1	PPS11832	240 WATT 48VDC ANTAIRA POWER SUPPLY	\$227.16
1	PPS12014	100W, 48VDC 2.0AMP DIN RAIL POWER SUPPLY	\$106.67
1	PPS12298-001	PWR SPLY,5A,240W,48VDC,DIN RAIL,1-OUTPUT	\$158.52
1	PPS12650-001	SOLAR KIT:60W,3M CBL,BRKT,BATT,AC CHRGR	\$1,457.43
1	PPS13162-001	POE INJECTOR,GIGABIT,48-55 VDC,MAX 2A	\$269.63
1	PPS13591-001	PWR SUPPLY:DBL CONVERSN,2.0KVA,W/HARNESS	\$5,192.55
1	PPS13772-001	Power Supply	\$94.07
1	PPS13888-001	Generator Switch	\$544.01
1	PPS13889-001	MANUAL BYPASS SWITCH,PTS MTD ON 19" EIA	\$398.27
1	PPS13925-001	480 Watt Series / 48 VDC / 10.0 Amps	\$306.67
1	PXX04273-006	ISOLTR,DC,4CH,244L,2009 Caltrans TEE	\$65.51
1	PXX04273P004	ISOLTR, DC, 2CH, 242,EDI	\$33.19
1	PXX06835P001	NEMA TS2 2-Channel DC Isolator Contact S	\$141.41
1	PXX08491-003	MONITOR:MMU2 16-CH,ENET PORT,LOAD SENSE	\$2,534.49
1	PXX08646-001	DETECTOR,OPTICAL,1WAY,SHORT LENS	\$247.27
1	PXX08770-001	DETECTOR,SHORT SIGHT TUBE,SINGLE W/MOUNT	\$332.27
1	PXX08959-001	DETECTOR,OPTICAL,1WAY,DETOC	\$369.41
1	PXX09019-001	DETECTOR,OPTICAL,2WAY,1OUTPUT,DETOC	\$420.20
1	PXX09019-002	DETECTOR,OPTICAL,INT CONF,LED,DETOC,W	\$555.56
1	PXX09217-001	DETECTOR,OPT,1W,1CH	\$369.41
1	PXX09557-001	ATC: CMU 16-32 CH. ETHERNT CMUIP-2212-HV	\$633.48
1	PXX09557-002	ATCC CMU 32 CH., ETHERNET CMUIP-2212-LV	\$633.48
1	PXX09557-003	CABINET MONITOR UNIT, IP MODEL	\$684.85
1	PXX09558-001	SIU: INTERFACE UNIT:SERIAL,SB1,1/2W	\$223.67
1	PXX10627-001	MONITOR:170 STANDARD,CALTRANS SIGNAL	\$382.40
1	PXX10883-001	SMART TRACKER BLACK	\$1,152.96
1	PXX10884-002	010-506-10 STANDARD, TRANSFER,SWITCH	\$405.93
1	PXX10884-004	SAFETY AUTO TRANSFER SWITCH	\$643.13

1	PXX10885-002	1.5KVA DOUBLE CONVERSION UNIT	\$1,803.54
1	PXX10885-003	010-030-20 EDP2000 DBL CONV UPS, 48VDC	\$4,337.26
1	PXX11073-002	MP2000E,INVERTER,1500W,SNMP E-CARD,TIP	\$1,681.10
1	PXX11259-001	EP-2200 UPS W/TEMP PROBE, USER MANUAL	\$1,668.90
1	PXX11322-001	COMMUNICATION CARD	\$297.22
1	PXX11476-001	SENSOR UNIT:VANT RADIUSPLUS,CONNECT	\$3,580.25
1	PXX11517-001	LOAD SENSOR UNIT,EDI,220VAC,60HZ,16CH	\$2,389.03
1	PXX12013-001	DETECTOR,OPTICAL,INT CONF,LED,2H,2W,WHT	\$930.74
1	PXX12500-001	BLADE: YUNEX NEXGEN BLADE	\$6,310.95
1	PXX13153-001	CHARGER:SOLAR BATTERY,24VDC TO 240VAC	\$78.64
1	PXX13400-001	DETECTOR:DATA GATHERING,POLE MNT,3' CBL	\$997.11
1	PXX13776-001	DETECTOR:SGL OS1 SENSOR,POE+ SPLITTER	\$23,088.02
1	PXX13777-001	DETECTOR:DBL OS1 SENSOR,POE+ SPLITTER	\$28,860.03
1	PXX13805-001	Digi Modem	\$1,325.93
1	PXX13876-001	MONITOR:8" LCD,VIDEO-HDMI-VGA INPUT	\$216.67
1	PXX13930-001	DETECTOR:SDLC INTERFACE,MODULE,POE,CAT5	\$19,208.33
1	PXX14023-001	CAMERA:FISHEYE 360 DETECTION,NIGHTVISION	\$1,229.17
1	SIE-8132-0000-018	M60 Series M62 NEMA Linux No Comm, SEPAC	\$2,944.00
1	SIU100	SERIAL INTERFACE: ITS CAB	\$245.31
1	SS-SBC66-46	3 SECTION VERT SIGNAL MOUNT, 66" CABLES	\$160.43
1	SS-SBC66-60	4 SECTION VERT SIGNAL MOUNT, 66" CABLES	\$166.93
1	SS-SBC66-74	5 SECTION VERT SIGNAL MOUNT, 66" CABLES	\$166.18
1	SS-SBC66-SCK	Cable Clamp 66" SS	\$93.07
1	SS-SBC66-TS-46	3 SECTION HORZ SIGNAL MOUNT, 66" CABLES	\$165.86
1	SS-SBC66-TS-74	5 SECTION HORZ SIGNAL MOUNT, 66" CABLES	\$180.20
1	TEM-EDGE-D-20X72	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Double-Sided, 20x72	\$1,852.81
1	TEM-EDGE-D-20X96	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Double-Sided, 20x96	\$2,142.86
1	TEM-EDGE-D-22X72	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Double-Sided, 22x72	\$1,948.05
1	TEM-EDGE-D-22X96	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Double-Sided, 22x96	\$2,316.02
1	TEM-EDGE-D-24X72	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Double-Sided, 24x72	\$1,955.27
1	TEM-EDGE-D-24X96	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Double-Sided, 24x96	\$2,292.93
1	TEM-EDGE-S-20X72	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Single-Sided, 20x72	\$1,847.04
1	TEM-EDGE-S-20X96	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Single-Sided, 20x96	\$2,138.53
1	TEM-EDGE-S-22X72	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Single-Sided, 22x72	\$1,939.39
1	TEM-EDGE-S-22X96	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Single-Sided, 22x96	\$2,304.47
1	TEM-EDGE-S-24X72	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Single-Sided, 24x72	\$1,945.17
1	TEM-EDGE-S-24X96	Temple Edge-Lit RAZOR LED Sign, Single-Sided, 24x96	\$2,278.50
1	TOM-1760-14	High Priority Hand Held Tester - Emergen	\$87.40
1	TOM-1881	Tomar 1881 card cage & harness assy.	\$139.09
1	TOM-4090-1-ST	Strobecom II Det - 1-Dir 1-Ch Self Test	\$387.88
1	TOM-4090-21-ST	Strobecom II Det - 2-Dir 1-Ch Self Test	\$441.44
1	TOM-4090-22-ST	Strobecom II Det - 2-Dir 2-Ch Self Test	\$614.14
1	TOM-4092-2C	DUAL DIRECTION OPTICAL DETECTOR W/LED CO	\$692.64
1	TOM-4140	4 Channel Optical Signal Processor w/eth	\$2,308.80

1	TOM-M913-1000	Detector cable, 3 conductor shielded – 1000' reel	\$636.61
1	UA242	4 ANCHR RD PACK	\$51.53
1	UKS1452AY	BRACKET ASSY:POLY SOP (YLW)	\$23.41
1	UL26	BRACKET: POLE MTG ASSY,CAB	\$39.97