
Item # Bid Item(s) Description Quantity UOM Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

1
Cabinet, Six Drawer, 33 inches, Underbench Model 4433-
Equipto, Color - Blue                                                             9 EA $1,046.00 $9,414.00 No Bid $0.00 

2

Large Flammable Material Cabinet  Model FSC45S, 
including Floor Anchors No. 190317A/ Qty 4 per cabinet 
(for sesimic bracing)-Equipto 10 EA $1,127.25 $11,272.50 No Bid $0.00 

3
Shop Storage Cabinet Model 1710 - Equipto, Color - Blue

7 EA $491.50 $3,440.50 No Bid $0.00 

4
Double Face Arm Rack Model Starter Unit 1050-72 with 
end unit 1050-Equipto, Color - Blue 6 EA $1,056.60 $6,339.60 No Bid $0.00 

5
6 Foot Wide, Single Face Arm Rack Model 1062-72 with 
1063-Equipto, Color - Blue 2 EA $565.00 $1,130.00 No Bid $0.00 

6

48" Bin Storage Rack Model 673-9S starter and 673-9A 
add-on, with accessories. Include Front Base No. 6804 
Qty 2, Bin Fronts No. 10516 Qty 8 and Dividers No. 8097 
Qty 40-Equipto, Color - Blue 2 EA $1,525.00 $3,050.00 No Bid $0.00 

7

Bulk Storage Rack-Model 1028D62S starter and 
1028D62A add-on, with accessories-Anchor 190319A (left 
ends), Anchor 190320A (right ends) and Anchor No. 
190317A (center)-Equipto, Color - Blue 74 EA $522.00 $38,628.00 No Bid $0.00 

8

18 Inch Shelving Unit Model 773-8S starter with 773-8A 
add-on, with accessories-Floor Anchors No. 190317A 
(four per starter unit, two per add on and polypropylene 
container No. 8501Y Quantity 20 containers-Equipto, 
Color - Blue 61 EA $341.25 $20,816.25 No Bid $0.00 

9
18 Inch Shelving unit with 6 Drawers Model S4205DN -
Equipto, Color - Blue 9 EA $1,842.00 $16,578.00 No Bid $0.00 

10
6 Foot Steel Receiving Table Model 2222D6-Equipto, 
Color - Blue 2 EA $408.50 $817.00 No Bid $0.00 

11
Delivery Charge

1 EA $6,000.00 $6,000.00 No Bid $0.00 

12
Installation Charge

1 EA $14,750.00 $14,750.00 No Bid $0.00 

$132,235.85 $0.00 

13

High Bay Pallet Rack - Model : Uprights 48H192, Beams 
N108, Decking WD5248L- Lyon Workspace Products

38 EA $457.60 $17,388.80 $948.00 $36,024.00 

14

6 Foot Bulk Storage Rack- Model 42H192, beams N108, 
decking WD5242L- with accessories-  Anchoring Foot No. 
65130 Qty 8  and Wedge No. 25163 Qty 16- Lyon 
Workspace Products 4 EA $457.60 $1,830.40 $1,163.00 $4,652.00 

15
Delivery

1 EA $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,215.00 $5,215.00 

16
Installation

1 EA $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 

$26,219.20 $54,891.00

$158,455.05 $54,891.00

Section A - Equipto (or Buyers Approved Equal )- per product specifications in Attachment C- Equipment List 1

Section B - Lyons Workspace Products (or Buyers Approved Equal) per product specifications in Attachment D- Equipment List 2
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